From: Forbes -, Laura

To: Sarah Wilkinson; Kerry Blake -
Subject: Re: Summit County Abatements

Date: Wednesday, July 08, 2020 11:24:18 AM
Sarah,

Actually deleting it and waiting for the corrected version is perfect. Kerry will be in the office tomorrow and she
will simply delete it out of our system and mail it back to you.

Thanks so much for your quick response!
Laura

Kerry, this is the Summit abatement that you are holding, let me know if you have any questions.

Laura Forbes

Property Tax Specialist

Division of Property Taxation

Cell Phone number: 303-947-8491

P 303-864-7764 | F 303-864-7799
1313 Sherman St., Suite 419, Denver, CO 80203

laura.forbes@state.co.us | www.dola.colorado.gov/dpt

Under the Colorado Open Records Act (CORA), all messages sent by or to me on this state-owned e-mail
account may be subject to public disclosure.

Flex Schedule: 7-4:30 with every other Monday off

On Wed, Jul 8, 2020 at 11:20 AM Sarah Wilkinson <Sarah.Wilkinson mmitcount v>
wrote:

Laura,

We will resubmit to the BOCC. If it’s easier for you to delete and we just send you the new one,
that’s fine with me.

Thanks!
-Sarah
From: Forbes -, Laura <laura.for tat >
Sent: Wednesday, July 08, 2020 7:20 AM
To: Sarah Wilkinson <Sarah.Wilkinson@summitcountyco.gov>

Subject: Re: Summit County Abatements

The commissioners need to rule on the corrected amount. It needs to go in front of the board
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again, it may be easier for us to just delete it and return it to you. Then you can send us the
corrected petition once it's gone before the board. You should probably also talk to the
county attorney.

Let me know if you want us to send it back to you.

Laura

Laura Forbes

Property Tax Specialist
Division of Property Taxation

Cell Phone number: 303-947-8491

]

P 303-864-7764 | F 303-864-7799

1313 Sherman St., Suite 419, Denver, CO 80203

laura.forbes@state.co.us | www.dola.colorado.gov/dpt

Under the Colorado Open Records Act (CORA), all messages sent by or to me on this state-owned e-mail account

may be subject to public disclosure.
Flex Schedule: 7-4:30 with every other Monday off

On Tue, Jul 7, 2020 at 4:32 PM Sarah Wilkinson <Sarah.Wilkinson@summitcountyco.gov>
wrote:

Hi Laura,

We would like to correct this clerical error. What do you need from us to do so? Can I just
correct the values listed on the current petition form and email that back to you?

Thanks,
-Sarah

From: Forbes -, Laura <laura.forbes(@state.co.us>

Sent: Thursday, July 02, 2020 4:39 PM

To: Sarah Wilkinson <Sarah.Wilkinson mmitcountyco.gov>

Cec: Mike Peterson <Mike.Peterson@summitcountyco.gov>; Frank Celico
<Frank.Celico@summitcountyco.gov>; Kerry Blake - <kerry.blake(@state.co.us>; Renee

Bridges - <renee.bridges(@state.co.us>
Subject: Re: Summit County Abatements

Thanks Sarah, sorry for the confusion. Have a great weekend too!
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Laura Forbes

Property Tax Specialist
Division of Property Taxation

Cell Phone number: 303-947-8491

P 303-864-7764 | F 303-864-7799
1313 Sherman St., Suite 419, Denver, CO 80203

laura.forbes(@state.co.us | www.dola.colorado.gov/dpt

Under the Colorado Open Records Act (CORA), all messages sent by or to me on this state-owned e-mail
account may be subject to public disclosure.

Flex Schedule: 7-4:30 with every other Monday off

On Thu, Jul 2, 2020 at 4:37 PM Sarah Wilkinson
<Sarah.Wilkinson@summitcountyco.gov> wrote:

Hi Laura,

Glad you were able to locate the documentation. Thank you for catching that error. I will
discuss with Frank and let you know how we would like to proceed.

Happy 4t to you too!
- Sarah

From: Forbes -, Laura <laura.forbes(@state.co.us>

Sent: Thursday, July 02, 2020 4:29 PM

To: Mike Peterson <Mike.Peterson(@summitcountyco.gov>; Frank Celico
<Frank.Celico@summitcountyco.gov>; Sarah Wilkinson
<Sarah.Wilkinson@summitcountyco.gov>; Kerry Blake - <kerry.blake@state.co.us>; Renee

Bridges - <renee.bridges(@state.co.us>
Subject: Re: Summit County Abatements

Hi Mike, Frank and Sarah,

I apologize, I missed the documentation, however, I found a discrepancy in the amount
approved for Vail Resorts. I've attached the abatement petition and 1 page of the BAA
decision. The BAA approved an actual value of $13,643,781 and the abatement is based
on a new actual value of $13,634,781 which results in an amount approved that's too
much by the amount of $134.98. Do you want to correct this and get it back to me?

The other abatement will be approved and returned to the county.

Thanks, hope you have a great 4th!
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Laura
Laura Forbes

Property Tax Specialist
Division of Property Taxation

Cell Phone number: 303-947-8491

P 303-864-7764 | F 303-864-7799
1313 Sherman St., Suite 419, Denver, CO 80203

laura.forbes(@state.co.us | www.dola.colorado.gov/dpt

Under the Colorado Open Records Act (CORA), all messages sent by or to me on this state-owned e-mail
account may be subject to public disclosure.

Flex Schedule: 7-4:30 with every other Monday off
On Thu, Jul 2, 2020 at 3:38 PM Forbes -, Laura <laura.forbes(@state.co.us> wrote:
Good Afternoon,

[ am reviewing two abatements from Summit County, one for Vail Resorts Schedule
number 6508534 in the amount of $28,798.24 and the second one for POWDR -
Copper Mountain Schedule number 700089 in the amount of $13,967.30. I have no
documentation as to the reason this abatement was approved; there is no assessor's
worksheet or or attachments, the only thing indicated on the form is that no protest
was filed for 2019.

Please help me understand why this is being processed and I would be happy to
continue my review.

Laura

Laura Forbes

Property Tax Specialist
Division of Property Taxation

Cell Phone number: 303-947-8491

P 303-864-7764 | F 303-864-7799
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